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The first book to explore the role of hair in women's lives and what it reveals about their identities,
intimate relationships, and work lives

Hair is one of the first things other people notice about us--and is one of the primary ways we declare our
identity to others. Both in our personal relationships and in relationships with the larger world, hair sends an
immediate signal that conveys messages about our gender, age, social class, and more.
In Rapunzel's Daughters, Rose Weitz first surveys the history of women's hair, from the covered hair of the
Middle Ages to the two-foot-high, wildly ornamented styles of pre-Revolutionary France to the purple dyes
worn by some modern teens. In the remainder of the book, Weitz, a prominent sociologist, explores--through
interviews with dozens of girls and women across the country--what hair means today, both to young girls
and to women; what part it plays in adolescent (and adult) struggles with identity; how it can create conflicts
in the workplace; and how women face the changes in their hair that illness and aging can bring. Rapunzel's
Daughters is a work of deep scholarship as well as an eye-opening and personal look at a surprisingly
complex-and fascinating-subject.
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From reader reviews:

Max Norris:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As we know that
book is very important for people. The book Rapunzel's Daughters: What Women's Hair Tells Us About
Women's Lives was making you to know about other know-how and of course you can take more
information. It is quite advantages for you. The guide Rapunzel's Daughters: What Women's Hair Tells Us
About Women's Lives is not only giving you far more new information but also for being your friend when
you experience bored. You can spend your own spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship
together with the book Rapunzel's Daughters: What Women's Hair Tells Us About Women's Lives. You
never feel lose out for everything in case you read some books.

Jack Alexandre:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive now, people
have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place
and notice by means of surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated the item for a
while is reading. Yep, by reading a e-book your ability to survive raise then having chance to stay than other
is high. For you personally who want to start reading a book, we give you that Rapunzel's Daughters: What
Women's Hair Tells Us About Women's Lives book as starter and daily reading reserve. Why, because this
book is more than just a book.

Karen Partain:

The guide untitled Rapunzel's Daughters: What Women's Hair Tells Us About Women's Lives is the
publication that recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be
shown to you actually. The language that writer use to explained their way of doing something is easily to
understand. The copy writer was did a lot of research when write the book, hence the information that they
share for your requirements is absolutely accurate. You also will get the e-book of Rapunzel's Daughters:
What Women's Hair Tells Us About Women's Lives from the publisher to make you considerably more
enjoy free time.

Candace Mathieu:

In this particular era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are
more valuable than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that.
What you should do is just spending your time little but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One
of many books in the top record in your reading list will be Rapunzel's Daughters: What Women's Hair Tells
Us About Women's Lives. This book which is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in turning
into precious person. By looking upwards and review this reserve you can get many advantages.
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