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Magic, murder and mayhem collide when an ordinary woman meets a powerful warlord — and writes
a bestselling, tell-all book...

It's got to be Stockholm Syndrome...

Eighteen fateful months ago, Sabra was kidnapped by the infamous magician warlord Cain Dath, and her
body just won't let her forget. Hidden in the humid depths of the Laos jungle, she shared everything with
him, but he never shared his heart.

In his position of power, Cain cannot show weakness. He must lead his people to freedom and no one — not
even the woman he's fast becoming obsessed with — can stand in his way.

Then Sabra sells her story of love slavery in a tell-all exposé and brings fame, fortune, and every one of his
enemies down upon them both. Now, she is open to attack on all fronts, and he can no longer stay away. The
man who enslaved her may well be the only man who can save her.Praise for A WARLORD'S LADY:

'It’s a fascinating read, very unusual and emotive. It involves conspraicies, plots by magical and non magial
beings, and is set in a world where magic is known and regulated.' — Jeannie Zelos

‘The world that the story takes place in was a nice unique twist on your everyday paranormal romance read.
’— Carrie Reads A Lot
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From reader reviews:

Donald Taylor:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new
facts. When you read a guide you will get new information simply because book is one of several ways to
share the information as well as their idea. Second, examining a book will make a person more imaginative.
When you reading a book especially fiction book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the
figures do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other folks. When you read this A Warlord's
Lady, you can tells your family, friends and also soon about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire the
others, make them reading a reserve.

Josephine Lowe:

The publication untitled A Warlord's Lady is the publication that recommended to you to study. You can see
the quality of the guide content that will be shown to a person. The language that publisher use to explained
their ideas are easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot of analysis when write the book, to ensure
the information that they share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You also will get the e-book of A
Warlord's Lady from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

Alan Castorena:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family, or their
friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, about to beach, or picnic from the park.
They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different to fill your
personal free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book can be option to fill your totally free time/ holiday. The
first thing that you ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to consider look for
book, may be the reserve untitled A Warlord's Lady can be very good book to read. May be it might be best
activity to you.

Robert Olsen:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside together with friends, fun activity along with family
or just watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by looking at a
book. Ugh, ya think reading a book can really hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It all
right you can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like A Warlord's Lady
which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's find.
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