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Author Dee Landers takes you on a journey in her past from 1978-1982. It was during that time she was
brutally beaten and raped twice, kidnapped and stabbed. She shares intrusive memories and some very
effective coping strategies that enabled her to be productive in life despite the inability to "fit in". She
describes herself as a lifeless walking zombie carrying an imaginary hundred pound backpack throughout the
dark periods of her life. Dee struggled, spiraled, and persevered repetitively. She suffered in solitude and
through the silence she developed an unyielding relationship with GOD and is a devout soldier in GOD's
army. The writing of her book was the result of many rape victims approaching her in an effort to learn how
she's able to wear a smile and move forward in life. Dee's response was and still is her tried and true coping
strategies which encompass the acronym: AFFTER (affirmations, FAITH, forgiveness, taking time for you,
expressing your emotions, and reinventing yourself). Dee, grew not only to accept her "new norm" but she
learned to love who she had become.

"Please...accompany me on my journey all while imagining being me so that you too... can witness HIS
wondrous works!"
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From reader reviews:

Glenda Rizzo:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing
for us to be aware of everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or maybe goal; it means that book
has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They are really reading
whatever they take because their hobby is reading a book. Think about the person who don't like reading a
book? Sometime, individual feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or exercise. Well,
probably you will require this From My Eyes Can You See, Can You Imagine Being Me?.

Dolores Wade:

The event that you get from From My Eyes Can You See, Can You Imagine Being Me? will be the more
deep you excavating the information that hide inside the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It
does not mean that this book is hard to understand but From My Eyes Can You See, Can You Imagine Being
Me? giving you buzz feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in selected way that can be
understood simply by anyone who read that because the author of this book is well-known enough. This
book also makes your vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand then can go along, both in
printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you for having this From My Eyes Can You See, Can You
Imagine Being Me? instantly.

Walter Telford:

This book untitled From My Eyes Can You See, Can You Imagine Being Me? to be one of several books in
which best seller in this year, that is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit upon
it. You will easily to buy this particular book in the book retailer or you can order it through online. The
publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, because you can read this
book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to you to past this e-book from your list.

Quincy Nelson:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With looking at you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can certainly share
their idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their particular reader with
their story or maybe their experience. Not only the story that share in the guides. But also they write about
advantage about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
children, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their
expertise in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write to the book. One of them is this From
My Eyes Can You See, Can You Imagine Being Me?.
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