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The environment of our planet is degrading at an alarming rate because of non-sustainable urbanization,
industrialization and agriculture. Unsustainable trends in relation to climate change and energy use, threats to
public health, poverty and social exclusion, demographic pressure and ageing, management of natural
resources, biodiversity loss, land use and transport still persist and new challenges are arising. Since these
negative trends bring about a sense of urgency, short term action is required, whilst maintaining a longer
term perspective. The main challenge is to gradually change our current unsustainable consumption and
production patterns and the nonintegrated approach to policy-making.

 

This book covers the broad area including potential of rhizospheric microorganisms in the sustainable plant
development in anthropogenic polluted soils, bioremediation of pesticides from soil and waste water, toxic
metals from soil, biological treatment of pulp and paper industry wastewater, sustainable solutions for agro
processing waste management, solid waste management on climate change and human health, environmental
impact of dyes and its remediation. Various methods for genotoxicity testing of environmental pollutants are
also discussed and chapters on molecular detection of resistance and transfer genes in the environmental
samples, biofilm formation by the environmental bacteria, biochemical attributes to assess soil ecosystem
sustainability, application of rhizobacteria in biotechnology, role of peroxidases as a tool for the
decolorization and removal of dyes and potential of biopesticides in sustainable agriculture.

 

It offers a unique treatment of the subject, linking various protection strategies for sustainable development,
describing the inter-relationships between the laboratory and field eco-toxicologist, the biotechnology
consultant, environmental engineers and different international environmental regulatory and protection
agencies.
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From reader reviews:

Daniel Reynolds:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children till adult are different content. We all know that
that book is very important normally. The book Environmental Protection Strategies for Sustainable
Development (Strategies for Sustainability) ended up being making you to know about other understanding
and of course you can take more information. It doesn't matter what advantages for you. The guide
Environmental Protection Strategies for Sustainable Development (Strategies for Sustainability) is not only
giving you much more new information but also to be your friend when you sense bored. You can spend
your own personal spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship with all the book Environmental
Protection Strategies for Sustainable Development (Strategies for Sustainability). You never really feel lose
out for everything in case you read some books.

Michele Anderson:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a concern. What people must be consider
any time those information which is within the former life are challenging be find than now's taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you have the
unstable resource then you get it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Environmental Protection Strategies for
Sustainable Development (Strategies for Sustainability) as your daily resource information.

Walter Reeves:

Reading a book for being new life style in this year; every people loves to read a book. When you study a
book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, because book
has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book that you have
read. If you want to get information about your study, you can read education books, but if you want to
entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, and also soon. The
Environmental Protection Strategies for Sustainable Development (Strategies for Sustainability) provide you
with a new experience in reading through a book.

Tracy Gardiner:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
simpler to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and
soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended for you is Environmental Protection Strategies for Sustainable Development (Strategies for
Sustainability) this publication consist a lot of the information in the condition of this world now. That book



was represented how does the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer make usage of to
explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some research when he makes this book. This is
why this book suitable all of you.
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