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? The goal of this book is to assess the efficacy of India’s financial deregulation programme by analyzing the
developments in cost efficiency and total factor productivity growth across different ownership types and
size classes in the banking sector over the post-deregulation years. The work also gauges the impact of
inclusion or exclusion of a proxy for non-traditional activities on the cost efficiency estimates for Indian
banks, and ranking of distinct ownership groups. It also investigates the hitherto neglected aspect of the
nature of returns-to-scale in the Indian banking industry. In addition, the work explores the key bank-specific
factors that explain the inter-bank variations in efficiency and productivity growth. Overall, the empirical
results of this work allow us to ascertain whether the gradualist approach to reforming the banking system in
a developing economy like India has yielded the most significant policy goal of achieving efficiency and
productivity gains. The authors believe that the findings of this book could give useful policy directions and
suggestions to other developing economies that have embarked on a deregulation path or are contemplating
doing so.
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From reader reviews:

Shawn Midkiff:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the concept Deregulation and
Efficiency of Indian Banks (India Studies in Business and Economics) suitable to you? Typically the book
was written by renowned writer in this era. Often the book untitled Deregulation and Efficiency of Indian
Banks (India Studies in Business and Economics)is a single of several books which everyone read now. This
kind of book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this publication you will enter the new
age that you ever know before. The author explained their idea in the simple way, and so all of people can
easily to understand the core of this book. This book will give you a wide range of information about this
world now. To help you see the represented of the world in this particular book.

John Valdez:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside along with friends, fun activity having family or
just watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by reading through a
book. Ugh, you think reading a book really can hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It all
right you can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Deregulation
and Efficiency of Indian Banks (India Studies in Business and Economics) which is keeping the e-book
version. So , why not try out this book? Let's find.

Catherine Scott:

Is it a person who having spare time and then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or
just lying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Deregulation and Efficiency of Indian Banks
(India Studies in Business and Economics) can be the answer, oh how comes? The new book you know. You
are consequently out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this completely new era is common not
a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?

Carolyn Bailey:

A lot of e-book has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by net on social media. You can
choose the top book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is named of
book Deregulation and Efficiency of Indian Banks (India Studies in Business and Economics). You can
contribute your knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge
and make you happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about guide. It can bring you from one
location to other place.
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