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Even as unemployment rates soared during the Great Depression, FDR’s relief and social security programs
faced attacks in Congress and the courts on the legitimacy of federal aid to the growing population of poor.
In response, New Dealers pointed to a long tradition—dating back to 1790 and now largely forgotten—of
federal aid to victims of disaster. In The Sympathetic State, Michele Landis Dauber recovers this crucial
aspect of American history, tracing the roots of the modern American welfare state beyond the New Deal
and the Progressive Era back to the earliest days of the republic when relief was forthcoming for the victims
of wars, fires, floods, hurricanes, and earthquakes.

 

Drawing on a variety of materials, including newspapers, legal briefs, political speeches, the art and literature
of the time, and letters from thousands of ordinary Americans, Dauber shows that while this long history of
government disaster relief has faded from our memory today, it was extremely well known to advocates for
an expanded role for the national government in the 1930s, including the Social Security Act. Making this
connection required framing the Great Depression as a disaster afflicting citizens though no fault of their
own. Dauber argues that the disaster paradigm, though successful in defending the New Deal, would
ultimately come back to haunt advocates for social welfare. By not making a more radical case for relief,
proponents of the New Deal helped create the weak, uniquely American welfare state we have today—one
torn between the desire to come to the aid of those suffering and the deeply rooted suspicion that those in
need are responsible for their own deprivation.

 

Contrary to conventional thought, the history of federal disaster relief is one of remarkable consistency,
despite significant political and ideological change. Dauber’s pathbreaking and highly readable book
uncovers the historical origins of the modern American welfare state.
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From reader reviews:

Sally Watts:

The book The Sympathetic State: Disaster Relief and the Origins of the American Welfare State can give
more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. Why then must we
leave a very important thing like a book The Sympathetic State: Disaster Relief and the Origins of the
American Welfare State? A number of you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim this book can
give many facts for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer along with your book.
Knowledge or data that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you could share all of these.
Book The Sympathetic State: Disaster Relief and the Origins of the American Welfare State has simple
shape however you know: it has great and big function for you. You can seem the enormous world by start
and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Bonnie Boyd:

Do you one among people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained within the straightway, hold on
guys this aren't like that. This The Sympathetic State: Disaster Relief and the Origins of the American
Welfare State book is readable by means of you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the data here
are arrange for enjoyable reading through experience without leaving even decrease the knowledge that want
to provide to you. The writer associated with The Sympathetic State: Disaster Relief and the Origins of the
American Welfare State content conveys the thought easily to understand by many individuals. The printed
and e-book are not different in the articles but it just different by means of it. So , do you nevertheless
thinking The Sympathetic State: Disaster Relief and the Origins of the American Welfare State is not
loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Mark Blanding:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the subject The Sympathetic
State: Disaster Relief and the Origins of the American Welfare State suitable to you? Typically the book was
written by well-known writer in this era. The book untitled The Sympathetic State: Disaster Relief and the
Origins of the American Welfare Stateis the main one of several books that everyone read now. This specific
book was inspired many men and women in the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new
dimensions that you ever know previous to. The author explained their idea in the simple way, and so all of
people can easily to recognise the core of this publication. This book will give you a large amount of
information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world with this book.

Doris Garcia:

You are able to spend your free time to learn this book this reserve. This The Sympathetic State: Disaster
Relief and the Origins of the American Welfare State is simple to develop you can read it in the recreation
area, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not get much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy



the actual e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone.
Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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