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Practical and concise, this introductory text for language teaching professionals is a guide to ESL assessment
and to fulfilling the testing component of TESOL programs in the U.S. and around the world. Covering the
fundamental descriptive and quantitative facets of effective language testing, it explicates key technical
aspects in an accessible, non-technical manner. Each chapter includes relevant practical examples and is
augmented by a partnered project that provides practical opportunities for readers to apply the concepts
presented in real testing situations.

Measurement and Evaluation in Post-Secondary ESL:

Discusses effective methods of evaluating the language proficiency of college-bound English language●

learners in various skills areas such as reading, oral proficiency, and writing

Takes a fresh look at accepted assessment concepts and issues such as validity and reliability, construct●

definition, authenticity, washback, reliable scoring, rater training, holistic and analytic rubrics, standardized
tests, and statistical concepts

Places special emphasis on innovative methods and alternative forms of assessment, such as self and●

portfolio assessment, as an adjunct to traditional methods

Reviews the changes in the new internet-based Test of English a Second Language launched in 2005●

Addresses the role and responsibilities of assessors●
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From reader reviews:

Pablo Torrey:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the publication entitled Measurement and Evaluation in Post-Secondary ESL. Try to stumble
through book Measurement and Evaluation in Post-Secondary ESL as your friend. It means that it can to be
your friend when you experience alone and beside associated with course make you smarter than ever before.
Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you far more confidence because you can know
almost everything by the book. So , we should make new experience along with knowledge with this book.

Nellie Ferguson:

Book is actually written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can learn everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important point to bring us around the world.
Alongside that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A guide Measurement and Evaluation in Post-
Secondary ESL will make you to always be smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can
know about everything. But some of you think that open or reading the book make you bored. It is not make
you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you searching for best book or suitable book with you?

Michelle Han:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be upgrade about what going on or details even
knowledge to make these people keep up with the era and that is always change and move ahead. Some of
you maybe will certainly update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice in your case but the
problems coming to anyone is you don't know what one you should start with. This Measurement and
Evaluation in Post-Secondary ESL is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, as
this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Jody Vinson:

Reading a book tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world may share their idea.
Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their reader with their story or perhaps
their experience. Not only the story that share in the publications. But also they write about the information
about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your kids,
there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors these days always try to improve their skill in
writing, they also doing some research before they write for their book. One of them is this Measurement and
Evaluation in Post-Secondary ESL.
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