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The Democratic Republic of Congo faces the challenge of providing universal primary education and
expanding opportunities for post-secondary education and training for its youth, ages 12 to 24. This study
analyzes the current educational attainment and school enrollment status of youth, as well as the formal and
informal post-secondary educational and training opportunities available to them. The study uses the results
of a simulation model that incorporates enrollment in alternative education programs and considers
alternative scenarios for developing the post-primary sector. Each scenario is evaluated for the impact on the
human capital accumulation of young people and the sustainability of public expenditures. The report offers
policy options for rapidly raising the educational attainment of young people who will be entering the labor
force in the next two decades, including expanding opportunities for alternative education and training for
out-of-school children, the extension of primary education, and the reorganization of secondary and
technical/vocational training to reduce early specialization.
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From reader reviews:

Henrietta Roderick:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they're still students or the idea for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that question above. Every person
has distinct personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that
they don't wish do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Changing the
Trajectory: 168 (World Bank Working Papers). All type of book would you see on many sources. You can
look for the internet options or other social media.

Emil Townsend:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading routine
give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the particular information
inside the book this improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of e-
book you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want really feel
happy read one using theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The particular Changing the
Trajectory: 168 (World Bank Working Papers) is kind of publication which is giving the reader unforeseen
experience.

Samantha Graham:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book specially book entitled
Changing the Trajectory: 168 (World Bank Working Papers) your mind will drift away trough every
dimension, wandering in each aspect that maybe mysterious for but surely can be your mind friends. Imaging
each word written in a guide then become one web form conclusion and explanation that maybe you never
get just before. The Changing the Trajectory: 168 (World Bank Working Papers) giving you yet another
experience more than blown away the mind but also giving you useful info for your better life within this
era. So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern here is your body and mind is going to be pleased when you
are finished reading it, like winning a game. Do you want to try this extraordinary paying spare time
activity?

Gregory Kile:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray an individual, why because this Changing the Trajectory: 168
(World Bank Working Papers) book written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book which
might be understand by anyone who read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, dripping every
ideas and producing skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still question Changing the
Trajectory: 168 (World Bank Working Papers) as good book not just by the cover but also by content. This is
one reserve that can break don't evaluate book by its protect, so do you still needing one more sixth sense to
pick this kind of!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening



to another sixth sense.
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