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Following Bogarde from childhood through adolescence, to the beginnings of his budding career, A
Postillion Struck By Lightning is a heartfelt memoir, offering insight into what created the drive and
charisma that eventually made him a star. Dreamy, sun-soaked summers full of freedom and mucking about
with his sister are mixed with holidays in France and rambling the countryside.

Writing plays instead of playing sports, Dirk's talents lie in the creativity of painting and expression rather
than in the precision of maths or science, much to the growing concern of his parents. Packed off to live with
relatives in Scotland, his father hopes that a proper Scottish education will equip his son to follow in his
footsteps for a career in Newspapers.

In Scotland, Dirk must learn to defend himself, he must learn to sound like a native Glaswegian, and hide his
intense homesickness. In essence; he must learn to act.

First published in 1977, A Postillion Struck by Lightning is written with irony and humour, tenderness and
flair.
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From reader reviews:

Bryant Kelly:

Often the book A Postillion Struck by Lightning will bring you to the new experience of reading the book.
The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. In the event you try to find new book to read, this book
very suitable to you. The book A Postillion Struck by Lightning is much recommended to you you just read.
You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Mary Gilbert:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray a person, why because this A Postillion Struck by Lightning guide
written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book that could be understand by anyone
who all read the book. Written in good manner for you, leaking every ideas and writing skill only for
eliminate your personal hunger then you still hesitation A Postillion Struck by Lightning as good book but
not only by the cover but also by content. This is one e-book that can break don't assess book by its deal
with, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your looking at sixth
sense already told you so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.

Isidro Wells:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside with friends, fun activity together with family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by studying a book. Ugh, do
you consider reading a book can really hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It alright you can
have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like A Postillion Struck by
Lightning which is keeping the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's notice.

Wanda Riddle:

E-book is one of source of knowledge. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen will need book to know the update information of year for you to year. As we know
those books have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the
world. By book A Postillion Struck by Lightning we can acquire more advantage. Don't that you be creative
people? To become creative person must choose to read a book. Merely choose the best book that suited with
your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life with that book A Postillion Struck by Lightning. You can more
inviting than now.
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