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The New York Times bestseller that explains why certain products and ideas become popular. “Jonah Berger
knows more about what makes information ‘go viral’ than anyone in the world” (Daniel Gilbert, author of
the bestseller Stumbling on Happiness).

What makes things popular? If you said advertising, think again. People don’t listen to advertisements, they
listen to their peers. But why do people talk about certain products and ideas more than others? Why are
some stories and rumors more infectious? And what makes online content go viral?

Wharton marketing professor Jonah Berger has spent the last decade answering these questions. He’s studied
why New York Times articles make the paper’s own Most E-mailed list, why products get word of mouth,
and how social influence shapes everything from the cars we buy to the clothes we wear to the names we
give our children.

In Contagious, Berger reveals the secret science behind word-of-mouth and social transmission. Discover
how six basic principles drive all sorts of things to become contagious, from consumer products and policy
initiatives to workplace rumors and YouTube videos. Learn how a luxury steakhouse found popularity
through the lowly cheesesteak, why anti-drug commercials might have actually increased drug use, and why
more than 200 million consumers shared a video about one of the most seemingly boring products there is: a
blender.

Contagious provides a set of specific, actionable techniques for helping information spread—for designing
messages, advertisements, and content that people will share. Whether you’re a manager at a big company, a
small business owner trying to boost awareness, a politician running for office, or a health official trying to
get the word out, Contagious will show you how to make your product or idea catch on.
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From reader reviews:

Ann Strickland:

This Contagious: Why Things Catch On book is not really ordinary book, you have it then the world is in
your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book is definitely information inside this reserve incredible
fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get. This
specific Contagious: Why Things Catch On without we understand teach the one who reading through it
become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't become worry Contagious: Why Things Catch On can
bring whenever you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' turn into full because you can have
it in the lovely laptop even cell phone. This Contagious: Why Things Catch On having excellent arrangement
in word along with layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Amber Tyson:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold
on guys this specific aren't like that. This Contagious: Why Things Catch On book is readable by simply you
who hate those perfect word style. You will find the details here are arrange for enjoyable looking at
experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want to give to you. The writer of
Contagious: Why Things Catch On content conveys objective easily to understand by many individuals. The
printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it just different by means of it. So , do you nonetheless
thinking Contagious: Why Things Catch On is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Everette Murray:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading
practice give you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge even the information
inside the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind
of publication you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with training books but if you want truly feel
happy read one having theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The actual Contagious: Why
Things Catch On is kind of guide which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Debbie Gray:

It is possible to spend your free time to read this book this e-book. This Contagious: Why Things Catch On is
simple to deliver you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not
possess much space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you better to
read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that
you will get when you buy this book.
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