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This is an accessible text for students of degrees and foundation degrees in Early Years and Early Childhood.
It examines both the theory behind early years practice, and the practical skills and knowledge needed for
effective practice. Covering themes such as child-centered practice, reflective practice, inclusive
environments and safe practice, it introduces you to the wide scope of practice in the early years. Practical
examples, case studies and theory focus features are included in all chapters to make links between theory
and practice. This is an accessible and comprehensive text enables you to develop the skills and knowledge
to approach practice in the early years.

About the Early Childhood Studies Series

This series has been designed to support students of Early Years, Early Childhood Studies and related
disciplines in popular modules of their course. Each text takes a focused look at a specific topic and
approaches it in an accessible and user-friendly way. Features have been developed to help readers engage
with the text and understand subject from a number of different viewpoints. Activities pose questions to
prompt thought and discussion and 'Theory Focus' boxes examine essential theory close-up for better
understanding. This series is also applicable to EYPS candidates on all pathways.

Other titles in the series include Early Childhood Studies, Childhood in Society for the Early Years, Child
Development for Early Years Students and Practitioners and Exploring Play for Early Childhood Studies.

Rose Envy is Senior Lecturer in Education at Teesside University. She is program leader for the BA (Hons)
Children & Early Childhood Degree and acts as Examination and Assessment Officer for the Education
Department within the School of Social Sciences and Law.



Rebecca Walters is a tutor fo the BA (Hons) Early Childhood Studies at Teesside University. She also
teaches on Teesside's Early Years (Sector Endorsed) foundation degree, hosted in Durham and Thirsk, and
delivers the Early Years Professional Status.
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From reader reviews:

James Kostka:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a stroll,
shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or even read a book allowed Becoming a Practitioner in the
Early Years (Early Childhood Studies Series)? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You recognize beside
you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree with its
opinion or you have various other opinion?

Clyde Connell:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students because they are still students or the idea for all
people in the world, the particular best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that query
above. Every person has several personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be obligated someone or
something that they don't wish do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book
Becoming a Practitioner in the Early Years (Early Childhood Studies Series). All type of book can you see
on many resources. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Mattie Peters:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their spare time with their family,
or their friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or picnic from
the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something different to fill
your own personal free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book may be option to fill your no cost time/
holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to
attempt look for book, may be the book untitled Becoming a Practitioner in the Early Years (Early
Childhood Studies Series) can be fine book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

Kirk Thomas:

Reading a book being new life style in this yr; every people loves to study a book. When you examine a
book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. In order to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if you
act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, and also
soon. The Becoming a Practitioner in the Early Years (Early Childhood Studies Series) will give you a new
experience in reading through a book.
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