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Over time, overemphasis and adherence to the same proven routines that helped your organization achieve
success can also lead to its decline resulting from organizational inertia, complacency, and inflexibility.
Drawing lessons from one of the best models of success, the evolutionary model, Inverting the Paradox of
Excellence explains why your organization must proactively seek out changes or variations on a continuous
basis for ensuring excellence by testing out a continuum of opportunities and advantages. In other words, to
maintain excellence, the company must be in a constant state of flux!

The book introduces the patterns and anti-patterns of excellence and includes detailed case studies based on
different dimensions of variations, including shared values variations, structure variations, and staff
variations. It presents these case studies through the prism of the "variations" idea to help you visualize the
difference of the "case history" approach presented here. The case studies illustrate the different dimensions
of business variations available to help your organization in its quest towards achieving and sustaining
excellence.

The book extends a set of variations inspired by the pioneering McKinsey 7S model, namely shared values,
strategy, structure, stuff, style, staff, skills, systems, and sequence. It includes case history segments for
Toyota, Acer, eBay, ABB, Cisco, Blackberry, Tata, Samsung, Volvo, Charles Schwab, McDonald's, Scania,
Starbucks, Google, Disney, and NUMMI. It also includes detailed case histories of GE, IBM, and UPS.
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From reader reviews:

Tiara Arnold:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive currently, people have do
something to make these survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and notice by means of
surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated it for a while is reading. Yes, by reading
a guide your ability to survive raise then having chance to endure than other is high. For you personally who
want to start reading a book, we give you this kind of Inverting the Paradox of Excellence: How Companies
Use Variations for Business Excellence and How Enterprise Variations Are Enabled by SAP book as basic
and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Michael Trejo:

Do you among people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on guys
this aren't like that. This Inverting the Paradox of Excellence: How Companies Use Variations for Business
Excellence and How Enterprise Variations Are Enabled by SAP book is readable by simply you who hate
those perfect word style. You will find the details here are arrange for enjoyable examining experience
without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to offer to you. The writer associated with
Inverting the Paradox of Excellence: How Companies Use Variations for Business Excellence and How
Enterprise Variations Are Enabled by SAP content conveys objective easily to understand by most people.
The printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it just different such as it. So , do you nonetheless
thinking Inverting the Paradox of Excellence: How Companies Use Variations for Business Excellence and
How Enterprise Variations Are Enabled by SAP is not loveable to be your top listing reading book?

Barbara Fontenot:

Typically the book Inverting the Paradox of Excellence: How Companies Use Variations for Business
Excellence and How Enterprise Variations Are Enabled by SAP has a lot of information on it. So when you
make sure to read this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was compiled by the very famous
author. The writer makes some research just before write this book. This particular book very easy to read
you can find the point easily after reading this article book.

David Bruce:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind skill
or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book in
comparison with can satisfy your short space of time to read it because all this time you only find reserve
that need more time to be go through. Inverting the Paradox of Excellence: How Companies Use Variations
for Business Excellence and How Enterprise Variations Are Enabled by SAP can be your answer as it can be
read by you who have those short time problems.
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