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Few names are so closely connected with the cause of human rights as that of Mary Robinson. As former
President of Ireland, she was ideally positioned for passionately and eloquently arguing the case for human
rights around the world. Over five tumultuous years that included the tragic events of 9/11, she offered moral
leadership and vision to the global human rights movement. This volume is a unique account in Robinson's
own words of her campaigns as United Nations High Commissioner for Human Rights.

A Voice for Human Rights offers an edited collection of Robinson's public addresses, given between 1997
and 2002, when she served as High Commissioner. The book also provides the first in-depth account of the
work of the Office of High Commissioner for Human Rights. With a foreword by Kofi Annan and an
afterword by Louise Arbour, the current High Commissioner for Human Rights, the book will be of interest
to all concerned with international human rights, international relations, development, and politics.
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From reader reviews:

Alice Hill:

The book A Voice for Human Rights (Pennsylvania Studies in Human Rights) make you feel enjoy for your
spare time. You may use to make your capable considerably more increase. Book can to be your best friend
when you getting anxiety or having big problem with the subject. If you can make looking at a book A Voice
for Human Rights (Pennsylvania Studies in Human Rights) to become your habit, you can get considerably
more advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your knowledge about some or all subjects.
You can know everything if you like available and read a e-book A Voice for Human Rights (Pennsylvania
Studies in Human Rights). Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or other
people. So , how do you think about this book?

Anita Cannon:

The feeling that you get from A Voice for Human Rights (Pennsylvania Studies in Human Rights) is a more
deep you looking the information that hide into the words the more you get interested in reading it. It doesn't
mean that this book is hard to be aware of but A Voice for Human Rights (Pennsylvania Studies in Human
Rights) giving you joy feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point in certain way that can be
understood through anyone who read the idea because the author of this e-book is well-known enough. This
book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand then can go with you,
both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for having this kind of A Voice for Human
Rights (Pennsylvania Studies in Human Rights) instantly.

Irene Wang:

You could spend your free time to see this book this publication. This A Voice for Human Rights
(Pennsylvania Studies in Human Rights) is simple to bring you can read it in the area, in the beach, train and
soon. If you did not have got much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is
make you easier to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits
that you will get when you buy this book.

Linda Cooper:

Publication is one of source of information. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but
native or citizen need book to know the upgrade information of year for you to year. As we know those
ebooks have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world.
From the book A Voice for Human Rights (Pennsylvania Studies in Human Rights) we can acquire more
advantage. Don't that you be creative people? To become creative person must like to read a book. Simply
choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life at this
book A Voice for Human Rights (Pennsylvania Studies in Human Rights). You can more desirable than
now.
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