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Celebrated for her exquisitely crafted poems revealing an alternate female reality, award-winning poet
and bestselling author Robin Morgan gives us, in this fifth collection, her most intimate work yet

The poems gathered here trace a stunning spectrum of love, betrayal, loss, pain, rage, and survival. Skirting
madness in the wake of a tempestuous relationship’s end, these poems slice language with knife-edge
bitterness, but within the deliberate constraints of form. Individual poems have become famous: “Add-Water
Instant Blues” is the most anthologized; “Cave Dwellers” and “Acrobats and Clowns” have been widely
translated; and the various “disguised,” subtle sonnet forms throughout the book have been used to teach the
art of writing poetry. Art itself becomes the healing theme, and a number of the poems here are in dialogue
with other poets, including Marianne Moore, Audre Lorde, Adrienne Rich, Muriel Rukeyser, Christopher
Marlowe, John Donne, William Blake, and Robert Graves. The wise voice that emerges dares celebrate a
quiet joy, tempered only by fire.
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From reader reviews:

Bessie Kraft:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive now,
people have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded
place and notice by surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated this for a while
is reading. That's why, by reading a guide your ability to survive increase then having chance to stay than
other is high. In your case who want to start reading a new book, we give you this particular A Hot January:
Poems 1996-1999 book as beginner and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is greater than
just a book.

Virginia Higgins:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the headline A Hot January:
Poems 1996-1999 suitable to you? Typically the book was written by well known writer in this era.
Typically the book untitled A Hot January: Poems 1996-1999is a single of several books which everyone
read now. This specific book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this e-book you will
enter the new dimension that you ever know just before. The author explained their plan in the simple way,
and so all of people can easily to be aware of the core of this publication. This book will give you a lot of
information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world in this book.

Jesse Hooker:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book than can satisfy
your short time to read it because this all time you only find reserve that need more time to be learn. A Hot
January: Poems 1996-1999 can be your answer because it can be read by an individual who have those short
free time problems.

Patti Wooden:

A lot of publication has printed but it is different. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the
most effective book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is called of
book A Hot January: Poems 1996-1999. You can include your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the
printed book, it may add your knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is most essential that,
you must aware about book. It can bring you from one location to other place.
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