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From Book 1:

In a small town like Solitude, Oregon, keeping a secret can be murder.

Stevie Taylor had left her sleepy Oregon hometown for a more exciting life. But after her police chief father
passes away, the LAPD cop returns to Solitude and signs on as a patrol officer, hoping to heal from her
loss…and from the horrific things she’s seen in the city.

In Solitude, everyone knows everyone else’s business—and, to Stevie’s dismay, local gossip soon ties her to
the new police chief and a man from her past. Tragedy then shakes up the small town when a teenager dies
after taking a strange new drug. Now, the seasoned LA cop must hunt down the dealer while investigating
the most important case of her life, one that could divide her tranquil town.

The first of four thrilling Rogue River novellas, On Her Father’s Grave launches a new romantic suspense
series from Kendra Elliot and Melinda Leigh.
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From reader reviews:

Matthew Williams:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. We all know
that that book is very important usually. The book Rogue River Novellas (4 Book Series) seemed to be
making you to know about other understanding and of course you can take more information. It is very
advantages for you. The book Rogue River Novellas (4 Book Series) is not only giving you considerably
more new information but also being your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your personal spend
time to read your reserve. Try to make relationship using the book Rogue River Novellas (4 Book Series).
You never really feel lose out for everything in the event you read some books.

Kim Salgado:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or maybe
playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity this is look different you can read any
book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent the whole day to
reading a e-book. The book Rogue River Novellas (4 Book Series) it doesn't matter what good to read. There
are a lot of those who recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this book. When you did
not have enough space to bring this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read
this book from the smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book has high quality.

Bruce Jackson:

This Rogue River Novellas (4 Book Series) is great e-book for you because the content which is full of
information for you who also always deal with world and still have to make decision every minute. That
book reveal it info accurately using great organize word or we can declare no rambling sentences within it.
So if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight
forward sentences but tricky core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having Rogue River
Novellas (4 Book Series) in your hand like keeping the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous one.
We can say that no guide that offer you world inside ten or fifteen minute right but this publication already
do that. So , it is good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt in which?

Carl Vang:

Many people spending their time by playing outside together with friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by reading through a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book can definitely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It
fine you can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Rogue River
Novellas (4 Book Series) which is keeping the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's see.
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