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SHE’D LIKE HER BLOOD BOTTLED, PLEASE!

The sassiest vampire in all of Manhattan, Lil Marchette, is the owner of Dead End Dating–a matchmaking
service for hip, intelligent singles like herself. After only three months, business is booming, and she can
finally pay her bills (or, more important, feed a hungry cosmetics addiction). But when one of her clients
turns up dead (as in never coming back), Lil is named as the prime suspect.
Murder?

Sure, she’s a vampire, but she can’t even work up her nerve when it comes to blood-sucking. Hacking
somebody to pieces is so out of the question.

To make matters worse, Lil must also contend with a pack of werewolves who ask–no, demand–that she find
each one a tall, dark, and handsome mate before the next full moon. Plus, the to-die-for-if-I wasn’t-already-
dead Ty Bonner, a lusciously sexy lover but totally unsuitable eternity mate, is never far from her midnight
fantasies. But Lil has no time for such thoughts. She must prove her innocence and focus on pairing off the
dead and the furry–and maybe stake a claim to her own tasty true love.

“Kimberly Raye is hot, hot, hot!”
–Vicki Lewis Thompson, author of Nerds Like It Hot

From the Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Sandra Yunker:

The book Dead and Dateless make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your capable
a lot more increase. Book can being your best friend when you getting anxiety or having big problem using
your subject. If you can make examining a book Dead and Dateless being your habit, you can get more
advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about many or all subjects. You are
able to know everything if you like start and read a reserve Dead and Dateless. Kinds of book are a lot of. It
means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this e-book?

Dustin Alvarez:

The ability that you get from Dead and Dateless could be the more deep you searching the information that
hide inside words the more you get interested in reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to
comprehend but Dead and Dateless giving you thrill feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point
in specific way that can be understood simply by anyone who read the item because the author of this
publication is well-known enough. That book also makes your current vocabulary increase well. It is
therefore easy to understand then can go along, both in printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you
for having this specific Dead and Dateless instantly.

Wilbert York:

The guide with title Dead and Dateless has a lot of information that you can understand it. You can get a lot
of gain after read this book. This book exist new expertise the information that exist in this e-book
represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to yo7u to learn how the improvement
of the world. That book will bring you inside new era of the internationalization. You can read the e-book on
the smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Laurie Cales:

You are able to spend your free time to learn this book this e-book. This Dead and Dateless is simple to bring
you can read it in the park your car, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not possess much space to
bring the actual printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save
the particular book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this
book.
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