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Since Vietnam introduced economic reforms in the mid-1980s, domestic service has become an established
sector of the labour market, and domestic workers have become indispensable to urban life in the rapidly
changing country. This book analyzes the ways in which the practices and discourses of domestic service
serve to forge and contest emerging class identities in post-reform Vietnam. Drawing on a rich and diverse
range of qualitative data, including ethnographies, interviews, and narratives, it shows that such practices and
discourses are rooted in cultural notions of gender and rural-urban difference and enduring socialist
structures of feeling, which, in turn, clash with the realities of growing differentiation. Domestic workers’
experiences reveal negotiations with class boundaries actively set by the urban middle class, who seek
distinction through emerging notions and practices of domesticity. These boundaries are nevertheless riddled
with gender and class anxiety on the side of the latter, partly because of the very struggles and contestations
of the domestic workers. More broadly, Minh T. N. Nguyen links the often invisible intimate dynamics of
class formation in the domestic sphere with wider political economic processes in a post-socialist country
embarking on marketization while retaining the political control of a party-state.

As a pioneering ethnographic study of domestic service in Vietnam today, this book will be of great interest
to students and scholars of Southeast Asian culture & society, social anthropology, gender studies, human
geography and development studies.
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From reader reviews:

Julianna Pepper:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading habit give you
lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge even the information inside the book that
improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of reserve you read, if
you want attract knowledge just go with education books but if you want feel happy read one having theme
for entertaining for example comic or novel. Often the Vietnam's Socialist Servants: Domesticity, Class,
Gender, and Identity (Asia's Transformations) is kind of reserve which is giving the reader capricious
experience.

Phyllis Kelly:

The book untitled Vietnam's Socialist Servants: Domesticity, Class, Gender, and Identity (Asia's
Transformations) is the e-book that recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the e-book
content that will be shown to anyone. The language that creator use to explained their way of doing
something is easily to understand. The author was did a lot of research when write the book, so the
information that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-book of Vietnam's Socialist
Servants: Domesticity, Class, Gender, and Identity (Asia's Transformations) from the publisher to make you
a lot more enjoy free time.

Robert Bowser:

Reading a book to become new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to go through a book. When
you learn a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge,
because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of
book that you have read. If you would like get information about your review, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and soon.
The Vietnam's Socialist Servants: Domesticity, Class, Gender, and Identity (Asia's Transformations) provide
you with new experience in looking at a book.

Wanda Jacobsen:

On this era which is the greater person or who has ability to do something more are more valuable than other.
Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you are related is just spending
your time little but quite enough to get a look at some books. One of several books in the top checklist in
your reading list is definitely Vietnam's Socialist Servants: Domesticity, Class, Gender, and Identity (Asia's
Transformations). This book that is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in getting precious
person. By looking right up and review this book you can get many advantages.
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