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Football Nation: Four Hundred Years of America's Game from the Library of Congress is an
unprecedented look at football from its early days in colonial America to the professional and college game
in the twenty-first century. This visually stunning social and cultural history contains nearly 400 images,
many rare or never before published, including memorabilia, cartoons, fine art, and game photographs. The
lively text examines how the game acquired its distinct American style, survived attempts to kill it, and
became the country’s dominant sport, while coping with wartime, social change, intensifying fan
participation, and corporate influence.

Throughout the book, illustrated features explore the history of the fight song, tailgating, and cheerleading;
how Hollywood has portrayed the game and its players; the long-running role of women in football; and the
impact of game-changing personalities from pioneer Walter Camp to Coach Vince Lombardi to
contemporary player agents. (Indeed, no other football book includes such a diverse range of figures as
Abigail Adams, Nathan Hale, Confederate general James Longstreet, Al Capone, Queen Elizabeth II, John
Lennon, Hirohito, several U.S. presidents, and Peyton Manning.) Quite simply, this book reveals how the
United States came to be Football Nation.

“With hundreds of illustrations from the incomparable collections of the Library of Congress this is a book to
treasure, not just read. The casual fan will be enchanted; the scholar will find something new on every page.”
—Dr. Michael Oriard, an English professor and dean at Oregon State University, former All American
offensive lineman at Notre Dame, former NFL player, and the author of Brand NFL: Making and Selling
America’s Favorite Sport

“Football Nation is an awesome read and unlike any other sports history I’ve come across. It’s great to see
how the game evolved in America and how it’s been a part of our history since the beginning.” —Eli
Manning, two-time Super Bowl MVP and quarterback for the New York Giants

Praise for Football Nation:
“Visually, this coffee-table book on football is a gem, featuring an abundance of black-and-white and color
photographs . . . this attractive and intelligent retelling of the growth and history of the game will appeal
equally to college and pro-football fans.” —Library Journal

“Sharp text . . . feast of archival material includes photos, drawings, reproduced magazine and newspaper
extracts." —BookPage.com

“A multifaceted, pictorial perspective on America’s favorite sport.” —Shelf Awareness
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From reader reviews:

Douglas Wyss:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yeah, you can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent all their spare
time to take a walk, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or even read a book called
Football Nation: Four Hundred Years of America's Game? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You
know beside you can spend your time using your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do
you agree with it has the opinion or you have some other opinion?

Carol Reck:

Book is definitely written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can know everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important thing to bring us around the
world. Close to that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A e-book Football Nation: Four Hundred
Years of America's Game will make you to be smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know about
every little thing. But some of you think that will open or reading any book make you bored. It is not
necessarily make you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you in search of best book or suited
book with you?

Michael Kenney:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive right
now, people have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of typically the
crowded place and notice by simply surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have
underestimated that for a while is reading. That's why, by reading a e-book your ability to survive raise then
having chance to remain than other is high. In your case who want to start reading the book, we give you this
kind of Football Nation: Four Hundred Years of America's Game book as beginner and daily reading
reserve. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Homer Gardner:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got students? We believe that that concern was
given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person such as reading or as examining become their hobby. You need to understand that
reading is very important along with book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to add you knowledge,
except your teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update regarding something by book. Amount types of
books that can you take to be your object. One of them is Football Nation: Four Hundred Years of America's
Game.
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