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Classroom Observation explores the pivotal role of lesson observation in the training, assessment and
development of new and experienced teachers. Offering practical guidance and detailed insight on an aspect
of training that is a source of anxiety for many teachers, this thought-provoking book offers a critical
analysis of the place, role and nature of lesson observation in the lives of education professionals.

Illustrated throughout with practical examples from a range of education settings, it considers observation as
a means of assessing teaching and learning and also as a way of developing teachers’ skills and knowledge.
Key topics include:

The purposes and uses of lesson observation●

The socio-political and historical context in which lesson observation has developed●

Practical guidance on a range of observation models and methods●

Teacher autonomy and professional identity●

Performance management, professional standards and accountability●

Peer observation, self-observation and critical reflection●

Using video in lesson observation.●

Written for all student and practising teachers as well teacher educators and those engaged in educational
research, Classroom Observation is an essential introduction to how we observe, why we observe and how it
can be best used to improve teaching and learning.
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From reader reviews:

Matthew Waddell:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to take a
wander, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or even read a book called Classroom
Observation: A guide to the effective observation of teaching and learning? Maybe it is for being best
activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can
smarter than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you have different opinion?

Donna Bradford:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone at
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even a problem. What people must be consider
when those information which is in the former life are difficult to be find than now's taking seriously which
one is appropriate to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable
resource then you get it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Classroom Observation: A guide to the effective
observation of teaching and learning as the daily resource information.

Anita Winn:

You can spend your free time to learn this book this reserve. This Classroom Observation: A guide to the
effective observation of teaching and learning is simple to develop you can read it in the park your car, in the
beach, train as well as soon. If you did not possess much space to bring the particular printed book, you can
buy the actual e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone.
And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Donna Davis:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-book
approach, more simple and reachable. This specific Classroom Observation: A guide to the effective
observation of teaching and learning can give you a lot of close friends because by you checking out this one
book you have point that they don't and make anyone more like an interesting person. That book can be one
of a step for you to get success. This publication offer you information that might be your friend doesn't
understand, by knowing more than various other make you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? We should
have Classroom Observation: A guide to the effective observation of teaching and learning.
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