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On May 29, 1917, Mrs. E. M. Craise, citizen of Denver, Colorado, penned a letter to President Woodrow
Wilson, which concluded, We have surrendered to your absolute control our hearts' dearest treasures--our
sons. If their precious bodies that have cost us so dear should be torn to shreds by German shot and shells we
will try to live on in the hope of meeting them again in the blessed Country of happy reunions. But, Mr.
President, if the hell-holes that infest their training camps should trip up their unwary feet and they be
returned to us besotted degenerate wrecks of their former selves cursed with that hell-born craving for
alcohol, we can have no such hope.

Anxious about the United States' pending entry into the Great War, fearful that their sons would be polluted
by the scourges of prostitution, venereal disease, illicit sex, and drink that ran rampant in the training camps,
countless Americans sent such missives to their government officials. In response to this deluge, President
Wilson created the Commission on Training Camp Activities to ensure the purity of the camp environment.
Training camps would henceforth mold not only soldiers, but model citizens who, after the war, would return
to their communities, spreading white, urban, middle-class values throughout the country.

What began as a federal program designed to eliminate sexually transmitted diseases soon mushroomed into
a powerful social force intent on replacing America's many cultures with a single, homogenous one. Though
committed to the positive methods of education and recreation, the reformers did not hesitate to employ
repression when necessary. Those not conforming to the prescribed vision of masculinity often faced
exclusion from the reformers' idealized society, or sometimes even imprisonment. Social engineering ruled
the day.

Combining social, cultural, and military history and illustrating the deep divisions among reformers
themselves, Nancy K. Bristow, with the aid of dozens of evocative photographs, here brings to life a pivotal
era in the history of the U.S., revealing the complex relationship between the nation's competing cultures,
progressive reform efforts, and the Great War.
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From reader reviews:

James Brier:

The book Making Men Moral: Social Engineering During the Great War (The American Social Experience)
make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You need to use to make your capable considerably more increase.
Book can to be your best friend when you getting stress or having big problem with the subject. If you can
make reading a book Making Men Moral: Social Engineering During the Great War (The American Social
Experience) to be your habit, you can get far more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your
knowledge about a number of or all subjects. You are able to know everything if you like open and read a
reserve Making Men Moral: Social Engineering During the Great War (The American Social Experience).
Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you
think about this publication?

Catherine Nelson:

Here thing why this kind of Making Men Moral: Social Engineering During the Great War (The American
Social Experience) are different and trustworthy to be yours. First of all reading through a book is good
nevertheless it depends in the content of computer which is the content is as delightful as food or not.
Making Men Moral: Social Engineering During the Great War (The American Social Experience) giving you
information deeper and in different ways, you can find any publication out there but there is no guide that
similar with Making Men Moral: Social Engineering During the Great War (The American Social
Experience). It gives you thrill reading journey, its open up your current eyes about the thing that happened
in the world which is possibly can be happened around you. You can easily bring everywhere like in area,
café, or even in your method home by train. When you are having difficulties in bringing the paper book
maybe the form of Making Men Moral: Social Engineering During the Great War (The American Social
Experience) in e-book can be your option.

Ramona Wegener:

This Making Men Moral: Social Engineering During the Great War (The American Social Experience)
usually are reliable for you who want to be a successful person, why. The explanation of this Making Men
Moral: Social Engineering During the Great War (The American Social Experience) can be among the great
books you must have is usually giving you more than just simple reading food but feed an individual with
information that maybe will shock your prior knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it everywhere
you go and whenever your conditions in e-book and printed people. Beside that this Making Men Moral:
Social Engineering During the Great War (The American Social Experience) forcing you to have an
enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary, giving you trial of critical thinking that we all know it
useful in your day activity. So , let's have it appreciate reading.



John Tovar:

This book untitled Making Men Moral: Social Engineering During the Great War (The American Social
Experience) to be one of several books which best seller in this year, this is because when you read this book
you can get a lot of benefit on it. You will easily to buy this particular book in the book retail store or you
can order it via online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book,
because you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason for your requirements to past this
publication from your list.
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