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Preserving the efficacy of herbicides and of herbicide-resistance technology depends on awareness of the
increasing resistance of weeds to herbicides used in agriculture and coordinated action to address the
problem by individuals at the farm level and beyond. This summit served as a venue to bring the attention of
important stakeholders to the issue and as an opportunity for experts from diverse disciplines to strategize in
a coordinated way to address herbicide-resistant weeds.

In convening stakeholders for this event, participants took a step toward a recommendation from the 2010
National Research Council report The Impact of Genetically Engineered Crops on Farm Sustainability in the
United States that federal and state government agencies, private-sector technology developers, universities,
farmer organizations, and other relevant stakeholders collaborate to document emerging weed-resistance
problems and to develop cost-effective resistance-management programs and practices that preserve
effective weed control. The summit provided the opportunity for stakeholders to explore the scientific basis
of the emergence of herbicide resistance and to consider different perspectives on both opportunities and
barriers to overcoming the problem of herbicide-resistant weeds. National Summit on Strategies to Manage
Herbicide-Resistant Weeds contains a brief synopsis of key points made by each speaker at the summit.
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From reader reviews:

Margherita Pettit:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be up-date about what going on or facts even knowledge
to make all of them keep up with the era that is always change and move forward. Some of you maybe will
probably update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to
anyone is you don't know what kind you should start with. This National Summit on Strategies to Manage
Herbicide-Resistant Weeds: Proceedings of a Symposium is our recommendation to cause you to keep up
with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and need in this era.

Tom Rivera:

The feeling that you get from National Summit on Strategies to Manage Herbicide-Resistant Weeds:
Proceedings of a Symposium is a more deep you digging the information that hide inside words the more
you get enthusiastic about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to know but National Summit on
Strategies to Manage Herbicide-Resistant Weeds: Proceedings of a Symposium giving you thrill feeling of
reading. The article author conveys their point in particular way that can be understood simply by anyone
who read the item because the author of this guide is well-known enough. This specific book also makes
your personal vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go together with you, both in
printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you for having this specific National Summit on
Strategies to Manage Herbicide-Resistant Weeds: Proceedings of a Symposium instantly.

Wesley Mansour:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This particular book National Summit on Strategies to Manage
Herbicide-Resistant Weeds: Proceedings of a Symposium was colourful and of course has pictures around.
As we know that book National Summit on Strategies to Manage Herbicide-Resistant Weeds: Proceedings of
a Symposium has many kinds or category. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or Private
eye Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are
generally make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book for
you personally and try to like reading this.

Amanda Young:

As a pupil exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library or to
make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's heart and
soul or real their interest. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to go to the library. They go to
presently there but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring and
also can't see colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important to suit your



needs. As we know that on this period, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, many ways
to reach Chinese's country. Therefore , this National Summit on Strategies to Manage Herbicide-Resistant
Weeds: Proceedings of a Symposium can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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