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After a series of low-paying jobs, Chico Santana, PI, is living in his tiny office on 149th Street in the Bronx.
He's in an absolutely foul mood when Pablo Sanchez and his mother drop in, seeking help for one of Chico's
old childhood pals----the handsome and charismatic Joey Ventura. Chico has not seen Joey since Joey
disappeared from St. Mary's Home for Boys, headed for Tahiti. He ended up, instead, on the island of TSP---
The Superman Project.

The Superman Project peddles German philosophy, Hinduism, and American comic book mythology as a
method toward self-improvement, but its members are hiding more than a few secrets. The leader of TSP is a
man named Father Ravi. One of his daughters, Gabby, who is also Joey's wife, is missing. Joey was accused
by the TSP leaders of killing Gabby and has fled the police. Pablo and his mother insist he is innocent.

Compelled to believe in his old friend, and by the promised payment of a very valuable Superman comic,
Chico investigates the competing interests in the organization, falling for a beautiful suspect and trying to
look out for a friend's troubled niece in the process.

A. E. Roman brings New York City and its eccentric characters to life in this second in the original and
energetic Chico Santana series.
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From reader reviews:

Matthew Armstrong:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book particularly book
entitled The Superman Project: A Chico Santana Mystery (Chico Santana Mysteries) your head will drift
away trough every dimension, wandering in each and every aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely can
be your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a guide then become one web form conclusion and
explanation in which maybe you never get just before. The The Superman Project: A Chico Santana Mystery
(Chico Santana Mysteries) giving you an additional experience more than blown away your thoughts but also
giving you useful data for your better life on this era. So now let us show you the relaxing pattern is your
body and mind will probably be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like winning a game. Do you
want to try this extraordinary shelling out spare time activity?

Priscilla McNeil:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make anyone
to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information much easier to
share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and soon. You
can observe that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The book that recommended to
you personally is The Superman Project: A Chico Santana Mystery (Chico Santana Mysteries) this e-book
consist a lot of the information on the condition of this world now. That book was represented how does the
world has grown up. The language styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. Often the
writer made some exploration when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book suitable all of you.

Vincent Cartagena:

Is it an individual who having spare time then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or
just resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Superman Project: A Chico Santana Mystery
(Chico Santana Mysteries) can be the answer, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are and so out
of date, spending your spare time by reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So what these
books have than the others?

Edgar Curtis:

As a student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library as well
as to make summary for some book, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's internal or
real their pastime. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to right now
there but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring along
with can't see colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important to suit your
needs. As we know that on this time, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, many ways
to reach Chinese's country. So , this The Superman Project: A Chico Santana Mystery (Chico Santana



Mysteries) can make you feel more interested to read.
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