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The short story is often viewed as an inferior relation to the Novel. But it is an art in itself. To take a story
and distil its essence into fewer pages while keeping character and plot rounded and driven is not an easy
task. Many try and many fail. In this series we look at short stories from many of our most accomplished
writers. Miniature masterpieces with a lot to say. In this volume we examine some of the short stories of GK
Chesterton. Gilbert Keith Chesterton was born in Campden hill, Kensington on May 29th 1874. Originally
after attending St Pauls School he went to Slade to learn the illustrators art and literature. In 1896 he joined a
small London publisher and began his journalistic career as a freelance art and literary critic. In 1901 he
married Frances Blogg, to whom he remained married for the rest of his life. Thereafter he obtained weekly
columns in the Daily News and The Illustrated London News. For many he is known as a very fine novelist
and the creator of the Father Brown Detective stories which were much influenced by his own beliefs. A
large man – 6’ 42 and 21st in weight he was apt to be forgetful in that delightful way that the British
sometimes are – a telegram home to his wife saying he was in one place but where should he actually be. But
he was prolific in many other areas; he wrote plays, essays, loved to debate and wrote hundreds of poems.
But in this volume we concentrate on his short stories especially those concerning a certain Father Brown.
Chesterton died of congestive heart failure on 14th June 1936 and is buried in Beaconsfield just outside of
London. Many of these stories are also available as an audiobook from our sister company Word Of Mouth.
Many samples are at our youtube channel http://www.youtube.com/user/PortablePoetry?feature=mhee
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From reader reviews:

Frances Small:

This book untitled The Flying Stars And Other Stories: "I am not absentminded. It is the presence of mind
that makes me unaware of everything else."  (Short Stories Of G.K. Chesterton) to be one of several books
which best seller in this year, this is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit into
it. You will easily to buy this specific book in the book store or you can order it through online. The
publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, because you can read
this book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason for you to past this e-book from your list.

Jessica Hodgkins:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family, or all their
friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic inside park.
They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to fill your own
free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book could be option to fill your cost-free time/ holiday. The first
thing that you will ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to try look for book,
may be the book untitled The Flying Stars And Other Stories: "I am not absentminded. It is the presence of
mind that makes me unaware of everything else."  (Short Stories Of G.K. Chesterton) can be very good book
to read. May be it might be best activity to you.

Alice Scales:

Precisely why? Because this The Flying Stars And Other Stories: "I am not absentminded. It is the presence
of mind that makes me unaware of everything else."  (Short Stories Of G.K. Chesterton) is an unordinary
book that the inside of the book waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will zap you with the secret the
item inside. Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who also write the book in such incredible
way makes the content inside easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning entirely.
So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This
excellent book will give you a lot of gains than the other book have such as help improving your skill and
your critical thinking approach. So , still want to delay having that book? If I were you I will go to the
reserve store hurriedly.

Leticia Bennet:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information quicker to
share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon.
You can view that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. Typically the book that
recommended to you is The Flying Stars And Other Stories: "I am not absentminded. It is the presence of



mind that makes me unaware of everything else."  (Short Stories Of G.K. Chesterton) this publication consist
a lot of the information in the condition of this world now. This particular book was represented how does
the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. Typically
the writer made some investigation when he makes this book. That's why this book appropriate all of you.
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