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La vecchiaia, in quanto capitolo finale, viene spesso confusa con l’idea di declino, chiusura e termine. I
vecchi, abbandonati come rottami in qualche “officina” geriatrica, si riconoscono quali scarti di un mondo
che non ha bisogno di impacci e perdite di tempo. Il testo di questa vecchia Signora, attraverso tre quadri-
affreschi, richiamo metaforico alla terza età, prova a riscattare l’ultima tappa della nostra esistenza
rendendola volutamente più lunga e sottolineandone la densità e la bellezza. Giunta all’ennesimo
compleanno, costretta nelle solitarie e indifferenti pareti di un ospizio, a causa del suo odio per le macchine
che ha più volte colpito con il suo bastone, obbligata ora a deglutire pasticche per vivere ancora un anno da
oggetto abbandonato in un cassetto; la signora Rossana accompagnata dalla dolce presenza del signor
Ernesto, malato di Alzheimer, nuota nel fiume di memorie-immagini, custodite gelosamente per tutta la vita.
I ricordi s’intrecciano ai desideri non ancora assopiti; la torta, il ballo e la presenza di Ernesto saranno il
giusto slancio per tornare a sentirsi viva e correre in discesa su una bicicletta che non si fermerà più.
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From reader reviews:

Mark Armstrong:

Throughout other case, little men and women like to read book L'ennesimo compleanno (Italian Edition).
You can choose the best book if you want reading a book. Given that we know about how is important a
book L'ennesimo compleanno (Italian Edition). You can add information and of course you can around the
world by just a book. Absolutely right, because from book you can realize everything! From your country
until eventually foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple thing until wonderful thing you can
know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or maybe searching by internet product. It is called e-book.
You may use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's learn.

Jocelyn Harper:

Does one one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Attempt to
pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't determine book by its deal with may doesn't
work this is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the outside
seem likes. Maybe you answer might be L'ennesimo compleanno (Italian Edition) why because the amazing
cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint an individual. The inside or
content will be fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly guide you to
pick up this book.

Samuel Puckett:

This L'ennesimo compleanno (Italian Edition) is great book for you because the content which is full of
information for you who all always deal with world and get to make decision every minute. This kind of
book reveal it facts accurately using great coordinate word or we can state no rambling sentences inside it.
So if you are read that hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you straight
forward sentences but hard core information with splendid delivering sentences. Having L'ennesimo
compleanno (Italian Edition) in your hand like keeping the world in your arm, information in it is not
ridiculous just one. We can say that no reserve that offer you world throughout ten or fifteen second right but
this publication already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still
doubt that?

Robin Lawrence:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, classifieds,
book, and soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The book that
recommended for you is L'ennesimo compleanno (Italian Edition) this reserve consist a lot of the
information on the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented how do the world has
grown up. The language styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made



some study when he makes this book. Here is why this book suited all of you.
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