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This 2003 book is concerned with two fundamental problems in low-dimensional topology. Firstly, the D(2)-
problem, which asks whether cohomology detects dimension, and secondly the realization problem, which
asks whether every algebraic 2-complex is geometrically realizable. The author shows that for a large class
of fundamental groups these problems are equivalent. Moreover, in the case of finite groups, Professor
Johnson develops general methods and gives complete solutions in a number of cases. In particular, he
presents a complete treatment of Yoneda extension theory from the viewpoint of derived objects and proves
that for groups of period four, two-dimensional homotopy types are parametrized by isomorphism classes of
projective modules. This book is carefully written with an eye on the wider context and as such is suitable
for graduate students wanting to learn low-dimensional homotopy theory as well as established researchers
in the field.
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From reader reviews:

Shawn Croll:

The book Stable Modules and the D(2)-Problem (London Mathematical Society Lecture Note Series) can
give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Why must we leave a good thing like a
book Stable Modules and the D(2)-Problem (London Mathematical Society Lecture Note Series)? Wide
variety you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim that will book can give many info for us. It is
absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, it is
possible to give for each other; you can share all of these. Book Stable Modules and the D(2)-Problem
(London Mathematical Society Lecture Note Series) has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great
and large function for you. You can appear the enormous world by start and read a guide. So it is very
wonderful.

Destiny Hunt:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a book will give you a lot of new data.
When you read a publication you will get new information because book is one of various ways to share the
information or even their idea. Second, reading a book will make anyone more imaginative. When you
examining a book especially fiction book the author will bring you to imagine the story how the characters
do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to others. When you read this Stable Modules
and the D(2)-Problem (London Mathematical Society Lecture Note Series), you can tells your family, friends
as well as soon about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a reserve.

Gail Brasfield:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, brief story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not attempting Stable Modules and the D(2)-
Problem (London Mathematical Society Lecture Note Series) that give your enjoyment preference will be
satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading practice all over the world can be said as the means for people
to know world considerably better then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be claimed
constantly that reading habit only for the geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to be success
person. So , for every you who want to start studying as your good habit, you may pick Stable Modules and
the D(2)-Problem (London Mathematical Society Lecture Note Series) become your starter.

Charles Brewster:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our know-how for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This book Stable Modules and the D(2)-Problem (London Mathematical Society Lecture Note
Series) was filled with regards to science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your scientific



disciplines competence. Some people has different feel when they reading the book. If you know how big
good thing about a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like at this point, many
ways to get book that you just wanted.
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