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Mobility has long been a defining feature of modern societies, yet remarkably little attention has been paid to
the various 'stopping places'_hotels, motels, and the like_that this mobility presupposes. If the paradoxical
qualities of fixed places dedicated to facilitating movement have been overlooked by a variety of
commentators, film-makers have shown remarkable prescience and consistency in engaging with these 'still
points' around which the world is made to turn. Hotels and motels play a central role in a multitude of films,
ranging across an immensely wide variety of genres, eras, and national cinemas. Whereas previous film
theorists have focused on the movement implied by road movies and similar genres, the outstanding
contributions to this volume extend the recent engagement with space and place in film studies, providing a
series of fascinating explorations of the cultural significance of stopping places, both on screen and off.
Ranging from the mythical elegance of the Grand Hotel, through the uncanny spaces of the Bates motel, to
Korean 'love motels,' the wealth of insights, from a variety of theoretical perspectives, that this volume
delivers is set to change our understanding of the role played by stopping places in an increasingly fluid
world.
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From reader reviews:

Alicia Hendrickson:

Book is definitely written, printed, or created for everything. You can know everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important factor to bring us around the world.
Beside that you can your reading talent was fluently. A reserve Moving Pictures/Stopping Places: Hotels and
Motels on Film will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know
about everything. But some of you think that open or reading the book make you bored. It is far from make
you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or appropriate book with
you?

Raymond Hollander:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material when you
want something to explain what your own problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy man? If
you don't have spare time to complete others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And
you have free time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. They must answer that question
since just their can do this. It said that about publication. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is proper.
Because start from on kindergarten until university need this Moving Pictures/Stopping Places: Hotels and
Motels on Film to read.

Jennifer Klein:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the time or they will get
great deal of stress from both day to day life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have time, we will
say absolutely indeed. People is human not just a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer may unlimited right. Then
do you try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, often the book
you have read is Moving Pictures/Stopping Places: Hotels and Motels on Film.

Lena Robertson:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is composed or printed or illustrated from each source that will filled update of news. With
this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media
social like newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You can add
your knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just searching for
the Moving Pictures/Stopping Places: Hotels and Motels on Film when you required it?
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