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Until attention shifted to the Middle East in the early 1970s, Americans turned most often toward the
Maghreb—Morocco, Algeria, Tunisia, and the Sahara—for their understanding of “the Arab.” In Morocco
Bound, Brian T. Edwards examines American representations of the Maghreb during three pivotal
decades—from 1942, when the United States entered the North African campaign of World War II, through
1973. He reveals how American film and literary, historical, journalistic, and anthropological accounts of the
region imagined the role of the United States in a world it seemed to dominate at the same time that they
displaced domestic social concerns—particularly about race relations—onto an “exotic” North Africa.

Edwards reads a broad range of texts to recuperate the disorienting possibilities for rethinking American
empire. Examining work by William Burroughs, Jane Bowles, Ernie Pyle, A. J. Liebling, Jane Kramer,
Alfred Hitchcock, Clifford Geertz, James Michener, Ornette Coleman, General George S. Patton, and others,
he puts American texts in conversation with an archive of Maghrebi responses. Whether considering Warner
Brothers’ marketing of the movie Casablanca in 1942, journalistic representations of Tangier as a city of
excess and queerness, Paul Bowles’s collaboration with the Moroccan artist Mohammed Mrabet, the hippie
communities in and around Marrakech in the 1960s and early 1970s, or the writings of young American
anthropologists working nearby at the same time, Edwards illuminates the circulation of American texts,
their relationship to Maghrebi history, and the ways they might be read so as to reimagine the role of
American culture in the world.
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From reader reviews:

Terry Grissom:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Sure, you
can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a walk,
shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open as well as read a book entitled Morocco Bound:
Disorienting America's Maghreb, from Casablanca to the Marrakech Express (New Americanists)? Maybe it
is to become best activity for you. You understand beside you can spend your time with your favorite's book,
you can wiser than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have different opinion?

Jody Watson:

This Morocco Bound: Disorienting America's Maghreb, from Casablanca to the Marrakech Express (New
Americanists) book is simply not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit
you will get by reading this book is actually information inside this book incredible fresh, you will get facts
which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get. This specific Morocco Bound:
Disorienting America's Maghreb, from Casablanca to the Marrakech Express (New Americanists) without
we recognize teach the one who reading through it become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't always
be worry Morocco Bound: Disorienting America's Maghreb, from Casablanca to the Marrakech Express
(New Americanists) can bring whenever you are and not make your tote space or bookshelves' come to be
full because you can have it in the lovely laptop even phone. This Morocco Bound: Disorienting America's
Maghreb, from Casablanca to the Marrakech Express (New Americanists) having excellent arrangement in
word and also layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Deborah Wilkerson:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you will have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try issue that really
opposite from that. One particular activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you have been ride on and with addition info. Even you love Morocco Bound: Disorienting
America's Maghreb, from Casablanca to the Marrakech Express (New Americanists), you could enjoy both.
It is fine combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh seriously its mind
hangout people. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its known as reading friends.

Debra McGregor:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many issue for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people
likes looking at, not only science book and also novel and Morocco Bound: Disorienting America's
Maghreb, from Casablanca to the Marrakech Express (New Americanists) as well as others sources were
given information for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel desire to read more and more.



Science e-book was created for teacher or even students especially. Those publications are helping them to
add their knowledge. In various other case, beside science guide, any other book likes Morocco Bound:
Disorienting America's Maghreb, from Casablanca to the Marrakech Express (New Americanists) to make
your spare time considerably more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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