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Through her incomparable work on screen, stage, record, radio, and television, Judy Garland earned renown
as “The World’s Greatest Entertainer.” It was as a motion picture star though, that she first rose to
international fame. From her feature film debut in 1936 through the aptly titled I Could Go on Singing in
1963, she lit up the screen with a magic uniquely hers—and dazzled world-wide audiences of all ages.
 
Judy Garland starred in two dozen of the all-time classic movie musicals, among them A Star is Born, Meet
Me in St. Louis, Babes in Arms, Easter Parade, For Me and My Gal, and The Harvey Girls. Her
dramatic turns in Judgment at Nuremberg, The Clock, and A Child is Waiting won added acclaim. And
perhaps most unforgettably, she starred as Dorothy Gale in the best-loved motion picture of all time: The
Wizard of Oz.
 
Judy: A Legendary Film Career tells the story of Garland’s movie work in unprecedented detail. Hundreds
of never-before-published photos, newly-assembled contemporary reviews, insight from her costars and
coworkers, and production histories are provided for each film in which she appeared. Highlighting and
complimenting the feature films is a definitive biography; an examination of Judy’s short subjects; details of
the movies she did not complete; and an enthralling compendium of film projects for which she was
considered or rumored. The text is illustrated by more than five hundred photos, encompassing poster art;
costume tests; behind-the-scenes candids; onstage and backstage glimpses of her theatrical successes; and
personal snapshots.
 
Judy is the exhaustively researched work of historian John Fricke. He celebrates as never before the heart,
humor, and incandescent motion picture achievement of the one-and-only Judy Garland.
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From reader reviews:

Judith Rayl:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until adult are different content. We all know that that
book is very important for us. The book Judy: A Legendary Film Career was making you to know about
other know-how and of course you can take more information. It doesn't matter what advantages for you.
The reserve Judy: A Legendary Film Career is not only giving you a lot more new information but also to
become your friend when you experience bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your
e-book. Try to make relationship with all the book Judy: A Legendary Film Career. You never feel lose out
for everything when you read some books.

Josephine McIntire:

The actual book Judy: A Legendary Film Career will bring you to definitely the new experience of reading
the book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. In the event you try to find new book you just
read, this book very appropriate to you. The book Judy: A Legendary Film Career is much recommended to
you you just read. You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can easier to read the
book.

Ann Morgan:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to opt for book
like comic, quick story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not hoping Judy: A Legendary Film
Career that give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading
addiction all over the world can be said as the method for people to know world considerably better then how
they react when it comes to the world. It can't be said constantly that reading routine only for the geeky
person but for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for all you who want to start looking at as your
good habit, it is possible to pick Judy: A Legendary Film Career become your starter.

Denise Barnhart:

In this particular era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more
special than other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you are
related is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to get a look at some books. Among the
books in the top listing in your reading list is Judy: A Legendary Film Career. This book which is qualified
as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in turning into precious person. By looking way up and review
this book you can get many advantages.
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