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From Book 1: Somewhere in a sea of tulle and taffeta, satin and crepe, Katie Fisher needs to find a key
ingredient of the perfect wedding--the groom.

Small-town girl Katie Fisher is busy planning her fairy-tale wedding. Sure, her boyfriend hasn't managed to
pop the question just yet, but that doesn't mean she shouldn't enter a contest in Texas Bride magazine to win
the dress of her dreams, right? Anyway, she's sure he'll be getting down on one knee any time now. And a
one-of-a-kind designer dress doesn't just fall out of the sky right when you need it.

But when Katie's boyfriend takes a job in another town and breaks up with her--on the very same day she
wins her dream dress--her world is turned upside down. Dare she go to Dallas to claim her prize? And will
the hunky pro basketball player who runs the beyond-swanky bridal shop--yeah, you read that right--discover
her humiliating secret if she does?

"Every Bride Needs a Groom is one to savor over and over. This compelling tale keeps you hooked and
ignites your heart. What an intriguing way to visit the culture of a small central Texas town."--Eleanor
Clark, award-winning author; motivational speaker; and Fairfield, Texas, resident

"Thompson launches a new bridal series with a contemporary, joyful Cinderella story that is filled with good
humor and old-fashioned Southern style. Readers will fall in love with Katie and the rest of the well-drawn
Fisher clan. This swoon-worthy tale will appeal to aficionados of humorous romances by Rachel Hauck and
Lisa Wingate."--Library Journal

Janice Thompson is a seasoned romance author and screenwriter. An expert at pulling the humor from the
situations we get ourselves into, Thompson offers an inside look at the wedding business, drawing on her
own experiences as a wedding planner. She is the author of the hugely popular Weddings by Bella series, the
Backstage Pass series, and the Weddings by Design series. She lives in Texas. Learn more at
www.janiceathompson.com.
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From reader reviews:

Scott Halpin:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. As it is known
to us that book is very important normally. The book Brides with Style (2 Book Series) had been making you
to know about other understanding and of course you can take more information. It is extremely advantages
for you. The reserve Brides with Style (2 Book Series) is not only giving you far more new information but
also to be your friend when you truly feel bored. You can spend your current spend time to read your book.
Try to make relationship together with the book Brides with Style (2 Book Series). You never really feel lose
out for everything in the event you read some books.

Norman Duque:

This Brides with Style (2 Book Series) book is simply not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in
your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is usually information inside this book incredible
fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you will get. This
particular Brides with Style (2 Book Series) without we know teach the one who studying it become critical
in thinking and analyzing. Don't end up being worry Brides with Style (2 Book Series) can bring whenever
you are and not make your case space or bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it in your lovely
laptop even cell phone. This Brides with Style (2 Book Series) having very good arrangement in word as
well as layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Jere Bingham:

The particular book Brides with Style (2 Book Series) has a lot details on it. So when you check out this
book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was authored by the very famous author. The writer makes
some research before write this book. This particular book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily
after looking over this book.

Antonio Batts:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book especially book
entitled Brides with Style (2 Book Series) your head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in
each aspect that maybe mysterious for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging every single word
written in a publication then become one type conclusion and explanation in which maybe you never get just
before. The Brides with Style (2 Book Series) giving you yet another experience more than blown away your
thoughts but also giving you useful info for your better life within this era. So now let us teach you the
relaxing pattern is your body and mind will be pleased when you are finished studying it, like winning a
game. Do you want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?



Download and Read Online Brides with Style (2 Book Series) Janice
Thompson #1CILNHEJZD0



Read Brides with Style (2 Book Series) by Janice Thompson for
online ebook

Brides with Style (2 Book Series) by Janice Thompson Free PDF d0wnl0ad, audio books, books to read,
good books to read, cheap books, good books, online books, books online, book reviews epub, read books
online, books to read online, online library, greatbooks to read, PDF best books to read, top books to read
Brides with Style (2 Book Series) by Janice Thompson books to read online.

Online Brides with Style (2 Book Series) by Janice Thompson ebook PDF download

Brides with Style (2 Book Series) by Janice Thompson Doc

Brides with Style (2 Book Series) by Janice Thompson Mobipocket

Brides with Style (2 Book Series) by Janice Thompson EPub

Brides with Style (2 Book Series) by Janice Thompson Ebook online

Brides with Style (2 Book Series) by Janice Thompson Ebook PDF


