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A century after the Cuban war for independence was fought, Louis Perez examines the meaning of the war of
1898 as represented in one hundred years of American historical writing. Offering both a critique of the
conventional historiography and an alternate history of the war informed by Cuban sources, Perez explores
the assumptions that have shaped our understanding of the "Spanish-American War"--a construct, he argues,
that denies the Cubans' participation in their own struggle for liberation from Spanish rule.

Perez examines historical accounts of the destruction of the battleship Maine, the representation of public
opinion as a precipitant of war, and the treatment of the military campaign in Cuba. Equally important, he
shows how historical narratives have helped sustain notions of America's national purpose and policy, many
of which were first articulated in 1898. Cuba insinuated itself into one of the most important chapters of U.S.
history, and what happened on the island in the final decade of the nineteenth century--and the way in which
what happened was subsequently represented--has had far-reaching implications, many of which continue to
resonate today.
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From reader reviews:

William Hoover:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they are still students or that for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that question above. Every person
has distinct personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they don't
would like do that. You must know how great and also important the book The War of 1898: The United
States and Cuba in History and Historiography. All type of book is it possible to see on many methods. You
can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Victoria Williams:

The book The War of 1898: The United States and Cuba in History and Historiography will bring one to the
new experience of reading a book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. When you try to find
new book to study, this book very ideal to you. The book The War of 1898: The United States and Cuba in
History and Historiography is much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-book from your
official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

Anna Snyder:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this The War of 1898: The United States
and Cuba in History and Historiography guide written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to
make book that may be understand by anyone who all read the book. Written with good manner for you,
dripping every ideas and writing skill only for eliminate your current hunger then you still hesitation The
War of 1898: The United States and Cuba in History and Historiography as good book not just by the cover
but also by the content. This is one book that can break don't evaluate book by its protect, so do you still
needing yet another sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already said so
why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.

Rick Fountain:

Is it you who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day through watching television programs or
just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This The War of 1898: The United States and Cuba in
History and Historiography can be the answer, oh how comes? A book you know. You are therefore out of
date, spending your time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these
textbooks have than the others?
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