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Symbolism is a marvelously instructive and expressive language. . . . It partakes of the language of the heart
and the language of the Spirit. . . . As Alonzo Gaskill deftly points out in this work, the language of
symbolism embraces everything from the dust of the earth to the glories of the heavens. To miss what is
being expressed or taught with symbols is like living in a world without sunsets or autumn leaves. — Joseph
Fielding McConkie

"All things have their likeness," the Lord has said, "and all things are created and made to bear record of me,
both things which are temporal, and things which are spiritual; things which are in the heavens above, and
things which are on the earth" (Moses 6:63).

"Symbolism is the very language of scripture," writes author Alonzo Gaskill. As we more fully understand
the symbolism in the scriptures and the temple, we are led to deeper, more profound insights and truths that
previously eluded us. The result is that we can then more readily liken the scriptures unto ourselves for "our
profit and learning" (1 Nephi 19:23).

This engaging and well-researched guide explores the symbolism of body parts, clothing, colors, numbers,
directions, names, and animals in holy writ and in the temple. It also provides a series of charts comparing
the lives of scriptural individuals and showing how they actually are types and symbols of Christ.

Filled with countless examples to help explain and support the author's discussion of symbols and their
meanings, the text makes extensive references not only to recognized Latter-day Saint sources but also to
lesser-known sources written by a variet1 of religious scholars both modern and ancient.

Symbolism is a language hidden in the margins, tucked between the lines, and suspended below the surface
of the words. With study and effort, we can coax the symbolic meaning into the open and become fluent in
reading the eternal truths it reveals. This book is an invaluable aid in that process.
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From reader reviews:

Shirley Smith:

The book The Lost Language of Symbolism: An Essential Guide for Recognizing and Interpreting Symbols
of the Gospel gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You should use to make your capable
considerably more increase. Book can to become your best friend when you getting tension or having big
problem together with your subject. If you can make examining a book The Lost Language of Symbolism:
An Essential Guide for Recognizing and Interpreting Symbols of the Gospel for being your habit, you can
get far more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about many or all subjects. You
could know everything if you like open and read a publication The Lost Language of Symbolism: An
Essential Guide for Recognizing and Interpreting Symbols of the Gospel. Kinds of book are several. It means
that, science publication or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about this book?

Ben Papenfuss:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside with friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by studying a book. Ugh,
do you consider reading a book will surely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It fine you
can have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like The Lost Language of
Symbolism: An Essential Guide for Recognizing and Interpreting Symbols of the Gospel which is keeping
the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's observe.

Alma Hillyer:

Is it anyone who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
lying on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Lost Language of Symbolism: An Essential Guide
for Recognizing and Interpreting Symbols of the Gospel can be the response, oh how comes? The new book
you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this new era is common not
a geek activity. So what these guides have than the others?

Diane Lomas:

Reserve is one of source of know-how. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but native
or citizen need book to know the update information of year in order to year. As we know those guides have
many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the world. By the book The
Lost Language of Symbolism: An Essential Guide for Recognizing and Interpreting Symbols of the Gospel
we can acquire more advantage. Don't you to be creative people? For being creative person must love to read
a book. Simply choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't become doubt to change your life with
this book The Lost Language of Symbolism: An Essential Guide for Recognizing and Interpreting Symbols
of the Gospel. You can more inviting than now.
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