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NOW THE ACCLAIMED HBO SERIES GAME OF THRONES

Here is the first volume in George R. R. Martin’s magnificent cycle of novels that includes A Clash of Kings
and A Storm of Swords. As a whole, this series comprises a genuine masterpiece of modern fantasy, bringing
together the best the genre has to offer. Magic, mystery, intrigue, romance, and adventure fill these pages and
transport us to a world unlike any we have ever experienced. Already hailed as a classic, George R. R.
Martin’s stunning series is destined to stand as one of the great achievements of imaginative fiction.

A GAME OF THRONES

Long ago, in a time forgotten, a preternatural event threw the seasons out of balance. In a land where
summers can last decades and winters a lifetime, trouble is brewing. The cold is returning, and in the frozen
wastes to the north of Winterfell, sinister and supernatural forces are massing beyond the kingdom’s
protective Wall. At the center of the conflict lie the Starks of Winterfell, a family as harsh and unyielding as
the land they were born to. Sweeping from a land of brutal cold to a distant summertime kingdom of
epicurean plenty, here is a tale of lords and ladies, soldiers and sorcerers, assassins and bastards, who come
together in a time of grim omens.

Here an enigmatic band of warriors bear swords of no human metal; a tribe of fierce wildlings carry men off
into madness; a cruel young dragon prince barters his sister to win back his throne; and a determined woman
undertakes the most treacherous of journeys. Amid plots and counterplots, tragedy and betrayal, victory and
terror, the fate of the Starks, their allies, and their enemies hangs perilously in the balance, as each endeavors
to win that deadliest of conflicts: the game of thrones.

From the Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Geraldine Dube:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? That's why, you
can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a move,
shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book titled A Game of Thrones:
The 20th Anniversary Illustrated Edition: A Song of Ice and Fire: Book One? Maybe it is to get best activity
for you. You already know beside you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can wiser than
before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have some other opinion?

Yolanda Matlock:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone at everywhere.
The information can be a know-how or any news even restricted. What people must be consider when those
information which is in the former life are hard to be find than now's taking seriously which one is
appropriate to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you find the unstable resource then
you buy it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will not
happen throughout you if you take A Game of Thrones: The 20th Anniversary Illustrated Edition: A Song of
Ice and Fire: Book One as your daily resource information.

Sandra Brown:

The book untitled A Game of Thrones: The 20th Anniversary Illustrated Edition: A Song of Ice and Fire:
Book One contain a lot of information on the item. The writer explains your ex idea with easy means. The
language is very simple to implement all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read it. The book
was published by famous author. The author gives you in the new age of literary works. You can read this
book because you can please read on your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book with anywhere
and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can start their official web-site and order it.
Have a nice learn.

Regina Hash:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. That book A Game of Thrones: The 20th Anniversary Illustrated
Edition: A Song of Ice and Fire: Book One was bright colored and of course has pictures around. As we
know that book A Game of Thrones: The 20th Anniversary Illustrated Edition: A Song of Ice and Fire: Book
One has many kinds or type. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan
you can read and feel that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are make you bored,
any it offers you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like reading
that will.
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